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ATOS RRL LEXILE Educational Description

Laboratory Books
Grace Harlowe's 
Freshman Year at High 
School

Jessie Graham Flower 9781946053015 fiction X 6 4-up n/a 920L

Aunt Claire Presents series, fictional girls 
adventure, mystery. Re-issue of early twentieth 
century literature. Front Matter- Point of view; 
Aunt Claire, narrative non-fiction, explanatory text, 
primary and secondary sources,  historical 
context; America's past. Story Elements: setting; 
1900's, Oakdale High School,  plot and character 
development. Comprehension strategy: compare 
and contrast books in a series (characters, setting 
and events) and literature from different eras- 
historical significance of language, nuances in 
word meanings,  dialect, values, culture) Literary 
elements: figurative language; metaphor, 
hyperbole, simile, conflict, style of writing, 
nuances in word meaning. Themes: High School, 
bullying, coming of age, friendship, loyalty

Laboratory Books The Automobile Girls 
at Newport

Laura Dent Crane 9781946053008 fiction X 6 4-up n/a 850L

Aunt Claire Presents series, fictional girls 
adventure, mystery. Re-issue of early twentieth 
century literature. Front Matter- Point of view; 
Aunt Claire, narrative non-fiction, explanatory text, 
primary and secondary sources,  historical 
context; America's past. Story Elements: setting; 
1900's, Newport, Rhode Island, plot and character 
development. Comprehension strategy: compare 
and contrast books in a series (characters, setting 
and events) and literature from different eras 
(historical significance of language, nuances in 
word meaning, dialect, values, culture) Literary 
elements: figurative language; metaphor, 
hyperbole, simile, conflict, style of writing. 
Themes: friendship, automobile travel, summer, 
social class, coming of age
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